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Is Competition Policy Useful
for Emerging Countries? An Empirical
Analysis

Roberto Pardolesi and Danilo Samà

Abstract
The ultimate objective of the paper is to empirically investigate the effectiveness
of competition policy in emerging countries, focusing on broader indicators of
market performance in order to understand whether the presence of an antitrust
authority has a significant impact, hence an effective utility, on the level of
competition of a developing country. From a policy perspective, the aim of the
paper is also to assess whether the enforcement of a competition policy regime in
a developing country has the same beneficial effects on the intensity of
competition usually claimed to take place in the most developed countries.
Relying upon a dataset and the connected econometric model developed by one
of the authors, we provisionally conclude that in developing countries the
institutional quality of the competition authorities matters more than the mere
existence or the degree of competence for the effectiveness of a competition
policy regime.
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1 Introduction

The ultimate objective of the present paper is to empirically investigate the effec-
tiveness of competition policy in emerging countries. Although its importance is
continuously increasing, the effectiveness of competition policy still seems to lack
the attention that it would deserve. At the present state of art, the number of
academic contributions that attempts to estimate its impact on relevant economic
variables appears very limited, in particular for the less developed countries.
However, an empirical literature aimed at measuring in objective terms the effect of
competition policy on economic growth is emerging, starting from narrow variables
of interest, such as Gross Domestic Product (GDP) and Total Factor Productivity
(TFP).

As a result, the current work intends to contribute to this branch of research,
focusing on broader indicators of market performance, to understand whether the
presence of an antitrust authority has a significant impact, thus an effective utility,
on the level of competition of a developing country. In other terms, the research
question behind the current work is rather straightforward: is a competition
authority active in an emerging country able to implement effectively its primary
role? If not, which are the institutional functions and powers that should be
strengthened?

From a policy perspective, the aim of the present paper is also to comprehend
whether the enforcement of a competition policy regime in a developing country
has the same beneficial effects on the intensity of competition usually claimed to
take place in the most developed countries. At the same time, it may also be
understood whether industrial and institutional differences jeopardize the effec-
tiveness of such a tool of political economy, so much that in emerging countries it
would be worthier to assign funds and priority to other tools for economic
development.

2 Literature Review

According to the mainstream economic school of thought, competition is the critical
process for a market economy to ensure the optimal allocation of resources and the
highest level of social welfare. As it is common knowledge, competitive markets
enable consumers to purchase better products at lower prices and incentivize firms
to improve the quality of the goods and services offered. However, the functioning
of competition is not automatic but must be sustained through an intervention by
the state, which normally occurs with the adoption of a competition legislation and
the creation of a competition authority predisposed to the role of promoter of
market democracy. Nevertheless, despite the general consensus, at least from a
theoretical standpoint, on the necessity of fostering competition in order to support
economic efficiency and fairness on the markets, what appears extremely surprising
is the quasi absence of academic contributions trying to assess empirically the
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effectiveness of competition policy. In the present section, therefore, we provide an
exhaustive overview of the results obtained in the empirical literature.

Dutz and Vagliasindi (2000) are the first authors to overcome the traditional
approach of the literature, based upon subjective indicators limited to an evaluation
of the competition legislations as “in the books”. The authors, in fact, exploiting
cross-sectional data and looking at the actual practice in 18 transition countries,
measure the effectiveness of the different competition policy regimes according to
three criteria (i.e. 1. enforcement; 2. competition advocacy; 3. institutional effec-
tiveness). The main result is a positive impact of competition policy on the intensity
of competition, the latter as captured by an indicator of economy-wide enterprise
mobility. However, the essential drawback of the study remains the low number of
countries for which data are available.

Krakowski (2005), after a regression analysis over a sample of 101 countries,
reaches two main conclusions: firstly, the experience of the competition authority
and the institutional quality of the government explain a substantial part of the
perception of the effectiveness of competition policy; secondly, the perceived
effectiveness of competition policy and the size of the economy have a significant
influence on the perceived intensity of local competition, while the presence of a
protectionist trade policy seems to not have any impact.

Kee and Hoekman (2007), analyzing a dataset of 42 countries and 18 industries
from 1981 to 1998 and controlling for the number of firms and for imports, study
the effect of competition policy on a derived industry mark-up function of price
over marginal cost, which is taken as a proxy for the intensity of competition.
Although no significant impact is found, the authors observe that market entry is
facilitated by the existence of a competition legislation, thus such a legislation has
an indirect and positive effect on the level of domestic competition. The main
drawback of the contribution is that it simply employs a binary variable indicating
whether a competition policy regime is in force.

Waked (2012) focuses on the public enforcement of competition policy in
developing countries, building an original dataset of 50 nations and exploiting 20
antitrust variables over a period of 10 years. The input variables present in the
dataset include information on budget and staffing levels, while the output variables
reflect data such as number of investigations initiated, cases decided, convictions
obtained, sanctions imposed, settlements reached and case appeled for abuse of
dominance, cartel and merger cases. The remarkable merit of the work is the
successful attempt to collect statistical data on the actual enforcement of compe-
tition policy in emerging countries, despite the common belief according to which it
would be an impossible task. The only drawback is the adoption of a resource-based
methodology for the input variables, as well as the employment of descriptive
statistics for the output variables which count the number of interventions by
antitrust authorities. In fact, endowments and resources of competition authorities
are a measure of potential enforcement intensity, while the number of interventions
is not a measure able to judge if the enforcement is efficient or not. Both elements
could be used by developing countries merely to assure and signal compliance to
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international standards. Nevertheless, the main conclusion of the paper still remains,
that is the fact that emerging countries which have adopted a competition policy
regime show an increasing degree of enforcement intensity.

Petersen (2013), using a dataset of 154 countries from 1960 to 2005, finds that
competition policy has a strong effect on the level of GDP after ten years, whilst
there is no relevant impact on the quality of democracy. Thus, market fragmentation
seems neither to favor the transition to a democratic regime nor to strengthen the
stability of an established democracy. The most plausible reason for this might be
that competition policy is not designed to prevent economic concentration at
conglomerate and national level (which, in turn, could promote democracy), but
only in particular and specific sectors. Also here, the main weakness of the study is
that the effect of competition policy is merely controlled for by a dummy variable.

Finally, Buccirossi et al. (2013) estimate the impact of competition policy on
productivity growth, analyzing a sample of 22 industries in 12 OECD countries
from 1995 to 2005. In order to measure the effectiveness of the different compe-
tition policy regimes, the authors construct, principally on the base of a tailored
questionnaire, a set of Competition Policy Indicators (CPIs), assessing, for each
country and each year, the antitrust infringements (the Antitrust CPI), the merger
control process (the Mergers CPI), the institutional features (the Institutional CPI),
the enforcement features (the Enforcement CPI) and all the information on the
competition policy regime in a jurisdiction (the Aggregate CPI). The main con-
clusion consists in a positive and significant relationship between competition
policy and TFP. Although the only drawback of the contribution is the small size of
the sample, exclusively restricted to a part of the OECD countries, the methodology
adopted as well as the indicators built are certainly very useful for further in-depth
analyses and refinements.

3 Dataset Description

In Samà (2014), the empirical assessment has been divided into two main parts. The
first part analyzes developed and developing countries together, to obtain a general
overview of the phenomenon studied. The second part examines exclusively
developing countries, to understand whether the adoption of a competition policy
regime should be among the priorities in the political agenda of an emerging
country. The main reason for this distinction is to disentangle the effect of com-
petition policy in such different contexts. This comparison may provide a better
picture of the impact, also because in developing countries competition policy has
been introduced only recently in comparison to developed countries.

Accordingly, the first group includes the majority of OECD countries (i.e.
28 nations), whilst the second group includes all the developing countries for which
data are available (i.e. 51 nations). Hence, the total number of countries present in
the sample is 79 (by 2008, 111 countries had enacted a competition legislation
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(Papadopoulos 2010). The result is a cross-sectional dataset, created ad hoc
merging several existing datasets, with 2008 as common reference year. For defi-
nitional sake, the term competition policy should be intended as any national law
which promotes market fairness by regulating anti-competitive conducts undertaken
by firms. With competition authority it is meant any institution which is set up for
enforcing competition policy and is not sector specific.

The independent variables of the dataset, i.e. the set of input variables to be
tested in order to verify if they are the cause of the phenomenon object of study,
results from a questionnaire submitted to competition agencies worldwide in 2007
and from which four indicators relative to the institutional quality of competition
policy of each country are derived and used in Voigt (2009). In particular, the
survey, whose response rate is around 63 %, was sent to 140 agencies belonging to
the International Competition Network or participating to the Intergovernmental
Group of Experts on Competition Law and Policy. The questionnaire was con-
structed so that respondents would not have to express personal perceptions but to
provide factual information about the national competition policies.

The dependent variables of the dataset, i.e. the set of output variables to be tested
in order to verify if they are instead the effect of the phenomenon object of study,
results from the Global Competitiveness Report, annually published by the World
Economic Forum (2013). It assesses the class of factors, institutions and policies
that influence the current and medium-term levels of economic prosperity of 144
different countries. Since 2004, the report proposes a wide range of data, based on
110 variables across 12 pillars, about areas such as competition, education, finance,
health, infrastructure, institutions, labour and technology. Data are collected
through over 15,000 surveys with leading business executives who are asked to
rank the determinants of competitiveness of their respective countries. This corre-
sponds to an average of 100 respondents per country. In particular, the study offers
the Global Competitiveness Indexes (GCI) (World Economic Forum 2013) mea-
suring the microeconomic and macroeconomic foundations of national competi-
tiveness worldwide.

In this regard, it is necessary to notice that, at least at the present state of art,
there is a practical impossibility to find objective data about the intensity of market
power, a solution that would represent of course a first best scenario. The basic
reason for this limitation is that data such as level of concentration, mark-up on
prices or number of market entries are available only for specific sectors of certain
nations and in any case would remain rather insignificant if computed with respect
to an entire economy. Thus, it is necessary to proceed to a second best scenario, that
is to resort to indicators of market performance obtained from evaluations expressed
by business respondents about a country competition intensity. Despite the
unavoidable drawbacks that this solution entails, being data extracted from surveys
not perfectly objective, the present paper still intends to investigate at a macro-
economic level whether the presence of a competition authority affects the degree of
competition of a developing country. Future research, having at its disposal more
rigorous and significant data, could certainly provide further answers to the research
question at issue.
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4 Econometric Model

The econometric model developed in Samà (2014) aims at estimating the effect on
market performance of competition policy in developing countries, the latter
evaluated according to four institutional indicators. These indicators, built in Voigt
(2009) and originally used to assess empirically the impact of competition policy on
TFP, measure: 1. the substantive content of the competition law; 2. the degree to
which the competition law incorporates an economic approach; 3. the formal
independence of the competition authority; 4. the factual independence of the
competition authority. In particular, as mentioned in the previous section, this set of
indicators has been constructed as a result of a questionnaire formed of 30 questions
and submitted to 140 competition authorities worldwide.

As a result, the four institutional indicators, which evaluate the degree of
competition orientation and authority independence, are investigated with respect to
the impact on five indicators of market performance. These five indicators of market
performance, built by the World Economic Forum (2013), measure: 1. the intensity
of local competition; 2. the extent of market dominance; 3. the effectiveness of
anti-monopoly policy; 4. the intensity of national competition; 5. the goods market
efficiency. In particular, as mentioned in the previous section, this set of indicators
has been extracted from the 6th pillar (i.e. Goods Market Efficiency) of the Global
Competitiveness Indexes (GCI).

Accordingly, in the econometric model, the four institutional indicators are
employed as explanatory and independent variables, whilst the five performance
indicators are used as explained and dependent variables. Nevertheless, all the
variables that may affect the relationship between the variables of primary interest
must be monitored, even though they may not be the focus of the study. Control
variables, in fact, allow the econometrician to strictly measure the effect under
examination, avoiding the so-called omitted-variables bias and improving the
goodness of fit of the econometric model. Therefore, along the lines of Voigt
(2009), four standard economic control variables are employed, such as government
consumption, trade openness, rate of inflation (Aten et al. 2002) and patents pro-
tection (U.S. Department of Commerce 2005), under the reasonable assumption that
they are all factors which influence, positively or negatively, the establishment of a
competitive environment. Moreover, two other control variables must be consid-
ered, that are an EU dummy, as the dataset includes countries members of the
European Union, which are thus subject not only to the respective national com-
petition authorities but also to the vigilance exercised by the Directorate-General for
Competition (DG COMP) of the European Commission, and an OECD dummy,
given the higher level of social welfare of OECD countries. The five control
variables are the same regardless of the dependent variable used, since the per-
formance indicators are likely to be affected by similar dynamics.

The high intensity of competition typical of developed countries, as well as the
high extent of market dominance typical of developing countries, might facilitate
the establishment and the effectiveness of a competition authority. This mechanism
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raises the question of endogeneity, as reverse causality (i.e. the effect precedes the
cause, contrary to normal causation) might emerge between the dependent and
independent variables of the econometric model. In order to deal with this issue, a
further category of variables is employed, that are the instrumental variables. In
particular, in the econometric model, the same three instrumental variables are used
for each of the four independent variables. Actually, endogeneity problems may
still remain due to omitted variables. However, to address the omitted variable bias,
several controls are employed as mentioned above.

The first instrument is a dummy variable for former British colonies (Aten et al.
2002). As proved by historical evidence, a common law legal system, typical of
countries that in the past belonged to the British Empire, is more likely to adopt a
competition policy regime compare to a civil law legal system, so that the legal
origin influences the enforcement of an institution such as a competition authority.
The second instrument is the age of democratic regime (Beck et al. 2001), under the
assumption that a country with a longer democratic tradition is in more suitable
conditions to establish and enforce a competition policy regime. The third instru-
ment is the ethnic and linguistic fractionalization (Alesina et al. 2003), element that
traduces the difficulty of implementing valuable institutions.

We can now proceed with the discussion of the estimation phase. At a first step,
the Ordinary Least Squares (OLS) method, without and with control variables, is
employed as estimation technique in order to carry out a preliminary assessment. At
a second step, after evaluating the validity of the instruments chosen through the
Sargan test, the Two-Stage Least Square (2SLS) and the Generalized Method of
Moments (GMM) are employed as estimation techniques, being able to improve the
prediction quality of the econometric model exploiting the information provided by
the instruments.

5 Estimation Results

In order to obtain a general overview of the phenomenon object of the study, firstly
developed and developing countries are analyzed together. Table 1 contains the
OLS regression estimates without and with the standard economic control variables.
It can observed that all the institutional indicators present the expected sign, that is
competition policy has a positive impact on all the performance indicators, although
rather marginal but more significant when control variables are considered. This
means that competition authorities, even if to a limited extent, are usually able to
implement effectively the role of promoters of fair competition. From Table 2,
which contains instead the OLS regression estimates over developing countries
only, we can observe that only the formal independence of the competition
authorities impacts positively on the performance indicators, while the degree to
which the competition law incorporates an economic approach and the formal
independence of the competition authority present a significant impact in a limited
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number of cases. On the contrary, the fact that an emerging country has adopted a
specific legislation safeguarding competition seems to not have any effect on the
markets.

For a more sophisticated inference analysis based on estimation methods such as
2SLS and GMM it is necessary first of all to check the relevance of the instruments
chosen. In an overidentified model, where the number of instrumental variables
exceeds the number of explanatory variables, the Sargan’s test can be used to verify
the validity of the instruments selected. The validity of the instruments for all four
institutional indicators of both developed and developing countries has been pos-
itively tested. Consequently, even though this test has low power and provides no
guarantee that the instruments used are valid, it brings further evidence to support
the direction of the model’s results.

Proceeding with the more advanced estimation techniques, from Table 3, which
contains the 2SLS and GMM regression estimates for the entire sample, we can
observe results that confirm those obtained under OLS. Although the substantive
content of the competition law seems to lose statistical significance, what emerges,
and this is more important for our purposes is that the estimates for the other three
institutional indicators are stronger than those obtained through the OLS estimation,
reaching in several cases the standard significance level of 5 %. Instead, from
Table 4, which presents the 2SLS and GMM regression estimates only for the
subsample of developing countries, we can observe results that confirm as well
what is stated in Table 2, that is the fact that in emerging countries the factual
independence of competition authorities seems to matter most. Furthermore, the
impact of the formal independence of competition authorities appears strengthened
in comparison to that one obtained through the OLS estimation, whilst the presence
of economists still maintains a positive effect in some cases.

6 Conclusions

In the present paper, the aim has been to investigate the effectiveness of competition
policy in developing countries from an empirical standpoint. It has shown that four
competition indicators, originally built to explain differences in productivity, once
controlled with the proper economic and institutional variables, seem to have an
effect on five market indicators. Although not particularly strong, the presence of a
competition authority increases the degree of competition of a country.

In particular, two main results are worth recapping. Firstly, as a general trend,
apart from the mere adoption of a competition legislation by the national parlia-
ments, all the institutional indicators exercise a positive impact on the markets,
therefore competition authorities seem to be effective in enhancing the level of
competitiveness of the respective countries. Secondly, as for the poorest countries,
with respect to which we are interested in verifying whether the enforcement of a
competition policy regime should be favored, what seems to be the most important
factor for its effectiveness is the factual independence of the authorities predisposed.
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The essential reason for this should be that the quality of the institutions of
developing countries is certainly lower than the one of the industrialized nations,
being affected more frequently for example by cases of corruption or government
interference. In any case, one conclusion seems certain, that is competition policy is
not harmful to development.

However, emerging countries, historically characterized by the nationalization of
basic industries, are still adopting or constructing primordial competition policy
frameworks, whose results could be seen only in delay, so in the near future.
Actually, to be more precise, 81 of the 111 of the existing competition authorities
worldwide have been created only in the last twenty years. Moreover, private
enforcement, although still in an embryonic phase even in the developed countries,
could undoubtedly make the market surveillance, thus the market efficiency,
stronger.

As a result, in developed countries competition policy has actually beneficial
effects on the intensity of competition, result so far unclear and often claimed only
on the paper or taken for granted, while in developing countries is not the mere
existence or the degree of competence, but the institutional quality of the compe-
tition authorities matters most for the effectiveness of a competition policy regime.
In both cases, therefore, the creation of a competition authority is definitely worth,
even though its functions and powers should be strengthened in order to register a
more significant impact on the markets in comparison to the current results. Future
research, exploiting more precise data that we hope will be available soon (e.g.
panel data concerning specific sectors and not as here cross-sectional data related to
an entire economy), could certainly offer further support to the conclusions here
reached.
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